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Question 2 Answer 2

3203415 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3206706 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

In principle yes.  However, I believe you need to be
more specific about the level of noise emanating from
cars (db specific).  Prohibiting congregation likely to
cause noise - again needs to be more specific about the
level of noise. {perhaps everything is repetitive and you
only really need the last three bullet points.

What positive action does the Council intend taking to
help divert these people's behaviour into more positive
activities?  The Council needs to seek to solve the real
problem and not just take the easy way out with the
\\"elastoplast\\" order



3206743 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3206880 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

No Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Moving groups on mean they will go elsewhere...like
Chepstow hospital. Little is done to police there. Why
not invest in things for them to do? Solve the cause,
don’t move the problem.

3206953 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3207148 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

They should be stoll able to congregate as long as they
don't cause the current issues. Otherwise they will just
be pushed to other areas

3207381 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

I fully support the Council in this proposed a bron

3207449 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3207499 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3207562 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3207569 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Although I would also like to suggest that providing
suitable youth services and activities would also be of
benefit.



3207787 05/02/2019 6:0
8

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3207801 05/02/2019 6:4
5

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3207875 05/02/2019 7:4
7

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3208208 05/02/2019 9:0
1

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3208570 05/02/2019 9:4
0

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Cameras and prosecute offenders

3209154 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3209196 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3210542 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

if it makes it easier to enforce rules that should be
adhered to anyway then it makes sense.

3218464 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

No Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Surely it's better than racing round the streats and it
gives everyone somewhere to chill whilst causing no
harm at all



3218469 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

No Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Whilst I appreciate all concerns raised within the above
consolation . I do feel a safe place for young people
needs to be provided as an alternative. I don't feel
banning congreation in carparks is the answer! I feel
that this proposed order isn't an effective solution, and
could cause issues elseware, such as racing on public
highways. Lapping of towns and streets and congreating
within a residential area (streets).

I urge Monmouthshire county council to consider this
order with extreme thought.

As a resident of Chepstow for 20 years, I was once
young and congregated in car parks to share my passion
of modified vehicles. Not all car enthusiasts are \\"boy
racers\\" and whilst I appreciate you haven't tarred
them with the same brush within your consultation I do
feel readers of this may do just that.

3219044 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3221297 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3221460 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3221489 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3221625 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3221600 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

We are a business Greenman Backpackers Ltd Our
rooms are directly located at the Welsh st car park
The noise and disruptive behaviour at night from car
enthusiasts and young people gathering with them is
causing us to loose business. It goes on until 2am some
nights with cars performing tyre burn outs, spinning
doughnuts, revving engines, shouting, loud music
Drinking and taking drugs. Let alone leaving their large
amounts of emty cans, food wrappers and other detritis
in the car park
Some of them even performing car maintenence,
changing tyres, spray painting etc. Something must be
done about this.
Several residents have suggested we get together and
compile a petition.



3221683 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Apart from the noise and regular disruption in Welsh st
car park sometimes untill the early hours. There is also
some aggressive behaviour from some of the hangers
on. Police have attended these incidents of aggression
and drunken behaviour
Some of the residents are afraid to say anything
because they have been threatened by certain
individuals. We all feel; helpless in the situation
Their antics are extremely dangersous I have an incident
on recording of one car doing a doughnut right outside
The Greenman Backpackers as people are laeving the
building

3221945 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

These cars are a danger speeding and causing  general
nuisance in Welsh street carpark I'm amazed No one has
been hurt the speed they drive..and the amount of litter
they leave lying around is disgusting.and a health
hazard.

3222240 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Whilst I have no problem with people congregating, it's
the litter they drop and the noise they make which is of
a concern. Perhaps undercover police could check the
area over when reported then fine them when they do
the illegal behaviour. Should sort it out in no time.



3222549 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3222555 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3222625 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3222636 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3223840 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3223887 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

No Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

You are seeking to criminalise 'normal' behaviours of
young people, who have no private space so have to
socialise in Public view. These are not 'crimes'.



3224070 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

No Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Build us a racetrack? Haha

Why plan to build more housing in the area, inviting
more people to the area when you can't handle the
couple of people that are already here expressing their
passion.

3224189 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

It is intimidating and pote tially dangerous as youngsters
rev up entering and leaving the carpark ( for effect of
course).  There is however, little for youngsters to do in
Chepstow ( and presumably other affected areas). The
skateparks are pretty poor and other more healthy
options can be expensive and require infrastructure and
investment (eg bike trails, sporting facilities, cafes. Ask
the kids.

3224336 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3224369 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

Support the initiative, but why limit this to car parks?
Will the limitations of this measure push the problem
elsewhere?

3224490 08/02/2019 1:3
0

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3224674 08/02/2019 7:2
3

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3224816 08/02/2019 8:2
7

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

You can hear the noise in the Dell (Welsh Street)
Chepstow Car Park from the English side of the river
opposite the Fairfield Mabey site.

3224957 08/02/2019 8:5
8

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3226656 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3227423 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3228473 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3228845 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

No Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3228985 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

No where else

3229051 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

The anti-social behaviour in the Chepstow car parks has
become very bad and needs to be addressed.

3229519 09/02/2019 0:3
5

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-



3229597 09/02/2019 7:2
3

anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3240619 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-

3268459 ############# anonymous@m
ycouncilservice
s.com

No location
available.

Do you support
this proposed
action ?

Yes Please
provide
further
comments in
relation to
this proposed
measure if
you wish ?

-


